Present: Michelle Nelson, Diane Reynolds, Hayley Bondi, Holly Petzak and Shan Gunawardena.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING
200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220

OCTOBER 31, 2024

#0755D, Alley — Boone, Main, Mechanic (eBidDoc# 9363601)
bid date/time: 10/31/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — Dan Shaw
NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC $73,820.00
Crystal Creek Concrete $95,385.00

Key Concrete, Inc. $69,010.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $82,882.25

MS Concrete LP $78,680.00

Vino Concrete Construction LLC $78,125.00
Engineer’s Estimate $86,620.00
#0801D, Alley — Forest, Delaware, Bayer (eBidDoc# 9363603)
bid date/time: 10/31/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — Dan Shaw
NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC $134,990.00
Crystal Creek Concrete $138,675.00

Key Concrete, Inc. $129,890.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $144,896.00

MS Concrete LP NO BID

Vino Concrete Construction LLC $132,917.00
Engineer’s Estimate $152,017.00

#67168, Westside Elevated Tank (eBidDoc# 9352903)
bid date/time: 10/31/2024 2:00 PM
owner: CU—KyleV

NAME BID AMOUNT
Bercot Inc $178,193.00
Exterior Service $147,310.00
Geiger Excavating $122,934.00
Krafft Water Solutions, LLC. $210,000.00
Underground Contractors Inc $109,575.00
Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $145,000.00
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Minutes

Bid Opening

#67367, St Joe Dam Bar Rack (eBidDoc# 9346381)
bid date/time: 10/31/2024 2:00 PM
owner: CU —Z Katter

NAME BID AMOUNT
Central Industrial Contractors $471,841.00

Grand River Construction, Inc NO BID

J.F. Brennan Company, Inc. NO BID

Jutte Excavating Inc NO BID

Ottenweller Contracting, LLC. $580,000.00

RAM Construction NO BID

Thieneman Construction $945,000.00
Woodruff Contracting and Sales $642,903.60
Engineer’s Estimate $145,000.00
#111-10-15-24-1, Harrison St Urban Trail (eBidDoc# 9361500)
bid date/time: 10/31/2024 2:00 PM
owner: CD - Holly

NAME BID AMOUNT
Crosby Excavating $1,283,084.25
Crystal Creek Concrete NO BID

DC Construction Services Inc. NO BID

E&B Paving Inc. NO BID

Exterior Service NO BID

Malott Contracting, Inc.

$1,392,620.65

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,606,925.06

Adjourn Time: _2:06 pm
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