CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING
200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
NOVEMBER 14, 2024

Present: Michelle Nelson, Nathan Baggett, Hayley Bondi, Pat Dooley, Bob Widner, Matt Gray and Christian

Harmeyer.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

#77271, Vallyd Acres Septic (eBidDoc# 9369599)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PM — Nathan B
NAME BID AMOUNT

API Construction

$1,342,867.75

Bercot Inc

$1,397,295.00

Bunn Excavating, Inc

$1,074,235.89

Campos Excavating LLC NO BID
Fleming Excavating Inc $1,461,356.09
Krafft Water Solutions, LLC. $731,222.00

VTF Excavation, LLC

$1,250,021.94

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,065,650.00

#0035A, Leesburg Rd Ext
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9375855)
11/14/2024 2:00 PM

owner: PW — P Zaharako
NAME BID AMOUNT
Apex Consulting & Surveying, Inc. NO BID

Brooks Construction Co Inc. $12,111,789.00
Bunn Excavating, Inc NO BID

County Materials Corp NO BID

E&B Paving Inc. NO BID

Fleming Excavating Inc $12,851,635.98
Fox Contractors NO BID
Milestone Contractors LP $11,980,765.00
Shambaugh & Son NO BID

wayne asphalt NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate

$11,582,117.15
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Minutes

Bid Opening

#0681A, Mt Vernon (eBidDoc# 9389690)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — B Widner
NAME BID AMOUNT

API Construction

$1,068,790.00

Brooks Construction Co Inc.

$1,144,087.00

CF Building Solutions NO BID
Fleming Excavating Inc NO BID
Milestone Contractors LP $1,140,470.51
MS Concrete LP NO BID
Shambaugh & Son NO BID

wayne asphalt

$1,138,861.50

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,280,315.00

#0735A, Harvester Ph Il (eBidDoc# 9387611)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — D Shaw

NAME BID AMOUNT

API Construction $2,496,300.00

Brooks Construction Co Inc.

$2,928,838.00

Crosby Excavating

$2,398,913.65

HIPSKIND CONCRETE CORP $2,568,51.00
Ley Excavating NO BID
Malott Contracting, Inc. NO BID
Milestone Contractors LP $2,470,255.80
Shambaugh & Son, LP NO BID
wayne asphalt NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate

$2,844,988.00

#0907N, Monroe St Lighting (eBidDoctt 9375858)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — P Dooley
NAME BID AMOUNT
Indoor Wireless $61,250.00
Kissinger Electric $82,625.00
Engineer’s Estimate $96,650.00
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Minutes Bid Opening
#0908L, 2025 On-Call Street Lighting (eBidDoc# 9377956)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — P Dooley
NAME BID AMOUNT
Indoor Wireless $26,571.65
Engineer’s Estimate $26,839.00

*RREFQ**

#111-10-8-24-1 RFQ CIPP (eBidDoc# 9326250)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: CU —Quandra
NAME Docs Rec’d
Apex Consulting & Surveying, Inc.
Fleis & VandenBrink
Hydro-Klean Rec’'d
Inliner Solutions, LLC Rec’'d
Insituform Technologies
Michels Trenchless Inc.
SAK Construction, LLC Rec’d
Visu-Sewer Rec’d

Vortex Services, LLC.

#111-10-8-24-2, 2024 CS NW Patio
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9365689)
11/14/2024 2:00 PM

owner: PM — Barry
NAME BID AMOUNT
CME Corporation $461,448.00
Crystal Creek Concrete NO BID

FCI Construction $512,900.00
Michael Kinder & Sons $470,000.00
Schenkel Construction Inc $422,200.00
Shawnee Construction $487,000.00
Strebig Construction $451,653.00
The Hagerman Group NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate

$498,000.00
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Bid Opening

#111-10-29-24-5, CD Wells St Demos (eBidDoc# 9385510)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: CD - Holly

NAME BID AMOUNT

Amor Excavating Inc $94,245.00

Bunn Excavating, Inc NO BID

Kreager Group Inc. $99,739.00

Nivek Earthworks LLC $64,215.50

Rezzar Demolition NO BID

Worx Companies $119,825.33
Engineer’s Estimate $113,395.00

#111-10-29-24-6, City FW Wayfinding
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9385511)
11/14/2024 2:00 PM

owner: CD - Holly

NAME BID AMOUNT

ADCON Signs NO BID

Archetype NO BID

Color-Ad, Inc. NO BID

Forge Signworks $821,300.00

Rocal, Inc. NO BID

Serigraphics Sign Systems, Inc NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate Unite Price $ 25,000.00

#111-10-29-24-7, CD S Anthony Streetscape (eBidDoc# 9385510)
bid date/time: 11/14/2024 2:00 PM
owner: CD - Holly

NAME BID AMOUNT
Bertsch-Frank & Associates, LLC NO BID

Brooks Construction Co Inc. NO BID

CF Building Solutions NO BID

Crosby Excavating $1,086,310.60

Ley Excavating NO BID

Malott Contracting, Inc. $1,068,464.20
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID

Shambaugh & Son, LP - UTILITY DIVISION NO BID

wayne asphalt NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $1,201,497.00

Adjourn Time: _2:19 pm
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