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Present: Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Ron Sheppard, Matt Gray, Ezra Broman, Matthew Grieger, Jacob Fowler, Matthew 

Konicek. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0762D, Alley                                                                 (eBidDoc# 9397249) 

bid date/time: 11/21/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Ezra B 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating LLC $70,000.00  
Crystal Creek Concrete $67,630.00  
Key Concrete, Inc. $72,170.00  
Malott Contracting, Inc. $81,563.50  
SHANNON CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION $66,895.00  
Vino Concrete Construction LLC NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $86,070.00 

 

 

#67003, Victoria Pk WMR                                            (eBidDoc# 9369590) 

bid date/time: 11/21/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Kyle V 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Fleming Excavating Inc $1,918,587.91  
Fox Contractors $1,359,773.00  
Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC $1,096,170.00  
S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. $1,152,940.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,250,920.00 

 

 

#67351, Anthony & Pettit WMR                                  (eBidDoc# 9375856) 

bid date/time: 11/21/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – M Konicek 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Fleming Excavating Inc $3,787,570.14  
Fox Contractors $3,238,871.00  
Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC $3,454,400.00  
S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. $2,736,750.00  
VTF Excavation, LLC NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $2,884,150.00 
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#77060, Engle Rd LS                                                      (eBidDoc# 9385525) 

bid date/time: 11/21/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – M Grieger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

CENTRAL INDUSTRIAL CONTRACTORS NO BID 

Jutte Excavating Inc $495,200.00  
Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $347,000.00 

 

 

#83968, Culvert Rehab 2024                                       (eBidDoc# 9367771) 

bid date/time: 11/21/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – J Fowler  

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Critical Pipeline Repair LLP NO BID 

Culy Contracting, LLC $158,055.00  
Inliner Solutions, LLC $365,500.00  
Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC NO BID 

Municipal and Contractors Sealing Products NO BID 

National Power Rodding Corp $565,100.00  
National Shotcrete dba National Gunite $236,540.00  
SAK Construction, LLC NO BID 

Structural Preservation Systems,LLC $293,863.00  
Temple and Temple Excavating & Paving $248,142.00  
US Infra Rehab Services $415,130.67  
Vortex Services, LLC. NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $351,000.00 

 

 

 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2: 10 pm 


