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Present: Michelle Nelson, Matthew Konicek, Nick Jarrell and Brad Lewis. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#67283, Lahmeyer State to Trier                                (eBidDoc# 9487201) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: CU  - M Konicek 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bunn Excavating, Inc NO BID 

Fleming Excavating Inc $515,305.92  

Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC $497,450.00  

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. $696,920.00  

Tice Provider Account NO BID 

VTF Excavation, LLC $482,878.00  

  
Engineer’s Estimate $517,100.00 

 

 

#0821C, Oakhurst Repairs                                            (eBidDoc# 9491438) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Christian 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Crystal Creek Concrete NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete Corp $1,768,148.00  

Key Concrete, Inc. $2,144,855.00  

Malott Contracting, Inc. $2,065,715.50  

Milestone Contractors LP $2,313,551.98  

  
Engineer’s Estimate $2,362,025.00 

 

 

#0923S, 2025 Barrett Law Cost Share                       (eBidDoc# 9508052) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete, Inc. $91,069.00  

Vino Concrete Construction LLC NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $91,447.00 total sum unit price  
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#0925S, 2025 ROW Misc.                                             (eBidDoc#9508073) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete, Inc. $91,017.00  

Malott Contracting, Inc. $91,099.50  

Shannon Concrete Construction NO BID 

Vino Concrete Construction LLC NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $91,971.50 total sum unit price 

 

 

 

#0926G, 2025 Concrete Curb                                      (eBidDoc#9508075) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete, Inc. $45,927.00  

Malott Contracting, Inc. $45,948.20  

Shannon Concrete Construction NO BID 

Vino Concrete Construction LLC NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $46,571.00 total sum unit price 

 

 

*****RFQ**** 

#0927P, RFQ 2025 Tree Removal                              (eBidDoc#9510226) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME RFQ Docs 

MERRELL BROS INC  
Monster Tree Service of Fort Wayne  
Ransom Discount Tree Service LLC  
Sunflower Lawn and Landscaping  
Tree Servants 1, LLC  
Worx Companies Rec’d Bid 

WRT Tree Services LLC  
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#0928S, 2025 Sidewalk Trip Haz                                 (eBidDoc#9508053) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

American Sidewalk Management NO BID 

Shannon Concrete Construction NO BID 

Universal Concrete Grinding $20.83  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $33.00  total sum unit price 

 

 

 

#0929U, 2025 ADA Curb Ramp                                    (eBidDoc#9508078) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

CF Building Solutions NO BID 

Key Concrete, Inc. $76,000.00  

Malott Contracting, Inc. $76,221.00  

Vino Concrete Construction LLC NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $77,116.00  total sum unit price 

 

 

#0932P, 2025 Guardrail & Attenuator                      (eBidDoc#9508092) 

bid date/time: 2/13/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Specialties Company $110,000.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $119,057.50  total sum unit price 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2: 18 pm 


