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Present: Michelle Nelson, Ron Sheppard, Matt Gratz, Jeff Bragiel, Wes Smith, Jason Acber, Matt Grieger, Tristan 

Riegler, Kristen Buell and Mike Kiester. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#111-2-20-24-1, Recycle Processing & Marketing  (eBidDoc# 9090753) 

bid date/time: 5/30/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: *** RFP*** SW – M Gratz 

NAME Doc’s Rec’d 

AMP  
GFL Enviromental Rec’d 

Quincy Recycle Paper  
Republic Services  Rec’d 

RUMPKE OF NORTHERN OHIO, INC. Rec’d 

Waste Management  Rec’d 

  
 

 

#12282 House Demo – Covington                              (eBidDoc# 9112295) 

bid date/time: 5/30/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: *** ITB*** PW – K Ramsey 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Sieber Brothers NO BID 

Worx Companies $26,588.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $25,500.00  

 

 

#67420, Air Scour Pipe Header                           (eBidDoc# 9110183) 

bid date/time: 5/30/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Matthew K 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Current Mechanical $484,000.00  
Jutte Excavating Inc $570,500.00  
Ottenweller Contracting, LLC. NO BID 

Project Design and Piping, Inc. $332,172.78  
Shambaugh & Son NO BID 

Thieneman Construction, Inc. $620,580.00  
Wagner- Meinert LLC $460,063.00  
Wein & Shearer Mechanical, Inc. NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $474,300.00  
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#77249 Rebid – Foster Park                                        (eBidDoc# 9082344) 

bid date/time: 5/30/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Kristen B 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Dunigan Bros., Inc. $3,708,705.18  
Fleming Excavating Inc NO BID 

Fox Contractors NO BID 

Thieneman Construction, Inc. $4,986,266.00  
TSW Utility Solutions NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $3,253,790.00  

 

 

#77301, 3RPORT Tunnel Power & Control              (eBidDoc# 9110200) 

bid date/time: 5/30/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Chris R 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

ElectricPlus NO BID 

Kissinger Electric Inc. $524,160.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $175,000.00  

 

 

#77323, Cherry Hill LS                                                 (eBidDoc# 9088654) 

bid date/time: 5/30/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – M Grieger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bercot Inc $258,561.00  
Central Industrial Contractors $281,000.00  
Ottenweller Contracting, LLC. NO BID 

R. G. Zachrich Construction, Inc. $364,500.00  
Thieneman Construction, Inc. $445,000.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $185,000.00  

 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:11 pm 


