Present: Michelle Nelson, Greg Kreiger, Greg McDirmit, Brian Kiess and Angela Erpelding.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING
200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220

JUNE 27, 2024

#0346S, N Clinton Sidewalk Ph 2
bid date/time:
owner:

(eBidDoc# 9147695)
6/27/2024 2:00 PM
PW — G McDirmit

NAME

BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating

$2,454,185.25

Hipskind Concrete Corp

NO BID

Malott Contracting, Inc.

$2,180,755.26

Milestone Contractors LP

$2,785,853.90

Engineer Estimate

$2,526,203.50

#0703D, Alley — Hugh, Eliza, McCulloch
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9167358)
6/27/2024 2:00 PM

owner: PW — Greg K
NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC $161,520.00
Exterior Service $183,575.00
Key Concrete, Inc. $192,894.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $164,196.20
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID
Shannon Concrete Construction $150,805.00
Engineer Estimate $168,835.00

#0708D, Alley — Colerick, Wildwood, Warsaw
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9169473)
6/27/2024 2:00 PM

owner: PW —Ezra B
NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC NO BID
Exterior Service $172,736.00
Key Concrete, Inc. $230,205.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $145,475.60
Engineer Estimate $141,831.00
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Minutes Bid Opening

#0732D, Covington Knolls (eBidDoctt 9167356)
bid date/time: 6/27/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — Greg K

NAME BID AMOUNT
Crosby Excavating NO BID

Hipskind Concrete Corp $1,387,575.00
Key Concrete, Inc. $1,657,700.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $1,149,954.00
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID

Engineer Estimate $1,319,050.00

#0748D, Alley — Esmond, Wildwood, Clinton (eBidDoct 9167357)

bid date/time: 6/27/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — Greg K

NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC NO BID

Exterior Service $119,514.00

Key Concrete, Inc. $136,100.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $111,196.50
Engineer Estimate $116,030.00

#0809D, Alley — Montclair, Main, Lindenwood (eBidDoc# 9158354)

bid date/time: 6/27/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW-Dan S

NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC NO BID

Exterior Service $48,638.25

Key Concrete, Inc. $75,465.00

Malott Contracting, Inc. $41,095.75
Shannon Concrete Construction $33,701.00
Engineer Estimate $34,478.75

#RFQ WPCP Headworks Screen Rebuild (eBidDoc# 9186053)
bid date/time: 6/27/2024 2:00 PM
owner: CU — C Ravenscroft
NAME Docs

Doc’s Crane Service Rec’d

G&L Corp

Adjourn Time: _2:15 pm
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