CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220

JULY 25, 2024

Present: Michelle Nelson, Greg McDirmit and Tim Byer.

Call To Order _2 :00 pm
#0697P, State Blvd Green (eBidDoc# 9196730)
bid date/time: 7/25/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW —PatZz
NAME BID AMOUNT
Bojrab Landscape Management NO BID
Exterior Service $148,112.00
Williams Creek Management $288,278.41
Worx Companies NO BID
Engineer’s Estimate $295,774.00

#0750D, Alley — Florence, Greenlawn, Wells
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9206277)
7/25/2024 2:00 PM

owner: PW — Greg M
NAME BID AMOUNT

Key Concrete, Inc. $112,462.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $103,278.20

Vino Concrete $91,707.00
Engineer’s Estimate $109,744.00
#0751D, Alley — Richardsville, Baxter, Avondale (eBidDoc# 9209435)
bid date/time: 7/25/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW-TimB

NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC NO BID

Key Concrete, Inc. $111,669.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $100,700.40
Shannon Concrete Construction $97,890.00

Vino Concrete $100,081.00

Engineer’s Estimate

$106,155.00
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Minutes

Bid Opening

#0752D, Alley — Baxter, McKinnie, Avondale (eBidDoc# 9209436)
bid date/time: 7/25/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW-TimB

NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC $108,105.00
Exterior Service $133,455.00

Key Concrete, Inc. $122,485.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $104,992.00
Shannon Concrete Construction $109,408.75

Vino Concrete $102,120.00
Engineer’s Estimate $114,543.00

#0753D, Alley — Dodge, State, Anthony

(eBidDoc# 9209436)

bid date/time: 7/25/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW —Greg M
NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC NO BID

Exterior Service $139,695.00
Key Concrete, Inc. $124,070.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $125,765.75
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID

Vino Concrete $102,335.00
Engineer’s Estimate $123,460.00
#0790D, Alley — Curdes, Dodge, Anthony (eBidDoc# 9209437)
bid date/time: 7/25/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW-TimB
NAME BID AMOUNT
Campos Excavating LLC $150,030.00
Exterior service $175,420.00
Key Concrete, Inc. $181,420.00
Malott Contracting, Inc. $165,212.00
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID

Vino Concrete $145,775.00
Engineer’s Estimate $161,070.00

Adjourn Time: _2:16_pm
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